
Har Ghar Tiranga at Sri Sathya Sai Institute of Higher Learning – A Report 

 

The students and staff of the Sri Sathya Sai Institution of Higher Learning actively 
participated in the Har Ghar Tiranga program as part of the Azadi Ka Amrut Mahotsav 
between 10-15 August 2022, across all its campuses. A brief report on the various activities 
is shared below: 
 

1. Pinning the Flag - Flags were pinned by SSSIHL on harghartiranga.com 
 

2. Selfie with Tiranga - The students actively participated in the Har Ghar Tiranga 
program by sharing their selfie pictures with the tricolour and uploading them on the 
Har Ghar Tiranga website. 
 

3. Hoisting the Flag -The national flag was hoisted on the institute and hostel 
buildings. In addition, the faculty and staff hoisted flags at their homes too. 
 

4. Photo spots were created for students and staff to take photographs with the 
Tiranga. Close to 400 photographs were taken. These photos are being uploaded on 
the harghartiranga.com website. 
 

5. A plantation activity was taken up by the students of the Muddenahalli campus - a 
few saplings were planted on the campus premises. 
 

6. Digital Poster – The students of the Muddenahalli campus designed a digital poster 
for the 76th Independence Day of our country. A printed miniature version of the 
poster was distributed among the students and staff to clip onto their shirts. 
 

7. Student Talks – During the Morning Campus Prayer, there was a talk by two 
students. Sri. Harsh Kumar of II M.Sc. (Biosciences), spoke on the HAR GHAR 
TIRANGA initiative by the Ministry of Culture, Government of India and Miss. Adithya 
Mishra, II M.Sc. Food & Nutritional Sciences spoke about the greatness of our 
Bharat, the exceptional lives of patriotic Bharatiyas, the virtues Bhartiyas are blessed 
with, and the importance of Indians realising their true potential and value of Bhartiya 
samskruti. 
 

8. A panel discussion by the students of Anantapur campus focusing on the landmark 
events from the pre-independence era to current day Bharat – beginning with the 
Battle of Buxar and Plassey, the revolt of 1857 to Jallianwala Bagh massacre, Civil 
Disobedience, Dandi March, Champaran, Satyagraha to post-independence 
milestones which include economic and social reforms, industrial & agricultural 
policies, and several achievements in the field of science and technology to current 
day initiatives like Digital India and the Vaccine Maitri 
 

9. Presentation by the students of Anantapur campus on the topic, “UNSUNG 
HEROES” by Miss Pratiksha Pradhan, Miss Shreya Jain, Miss Saring Gurung, and 
Miss Bilvani Saina, students of B.A. (History) who spoke on the contributions of brave 
freedom fighters like Khudiram Bose, Matagani Hazra, Lakshmi Sehgal, and Helen 
Lepcha 
 

10. Narrations and character depictions by students depicted the heroic movements in 
India’s independence struggles like the 1857 revolt, Champaran Movement, and 
Vande Mataram Movement. 
 



11. India as ‘Sone ki Chidiya’ was depicted by the students through the life of great 
rulers from Ancient Indian History such as Chandragupta Maurya, Ashoka, and 
others. 
 

12. A dance presentation depicting Unity in diversity – various classical dance forms 
including Kathak, Kuchipudi, Bharatanatyam, and Mohiniattam were performed 
showcasing the beauty of Indian culture. 
 

13. A video presentation titled ‘Vande Mataram’ showcased the cultural heritage of 
India from east to west and North to south. It showed how the National flag is held 
high in the dryness of the desert as well as in the heights of the mountains and the 
depth of the ocean. The program rekindled the pride of being an Indian. 
 

14. Partition Horror was observed across campuses, a detailed report for which has 
been already shared separately. View report on Partition Horrors. 
 

15. A song presentation ‘Ae Watan Mere’ was melodiously rendered filling the entire 
audience with the feeling of love and reverence for the motherland. 
 

16. A dance presentation depicting the spirit of the Indian flag and the joy of celebrating 
Azadi ka Amrit Mahotsav by students of 1st year B.Ed. and 1st-year P.G. Bioscience, 
which energized the audience 
 

17. A video presentation of the Har Ghar Tiranga song motivated and brought in a 
sense of patriotism amongst the students and staff 
 

18. A declamation programme saw 4 students – Miss C Ramya Keethana of III B.A. as 
Subash Chandra Bose, Miss Ashmenee Mangrati of III B.A. as Annie Besant, Miss 
Anamika Rai of III B.A. as Jawaharlal Nehru and Miss Sai Harini R of III B. Com. as 
Sarojini Naidu, inspire the audience through powerful delivery of excerpts of famous 
speeches delivered by their respective personalities during the Independence 
struggle.  
 

19. A video presentation depicted the struggle and bravery of the Indian soldiers who 

protect the country while the nation sleeps peacefully.   
 

20. Click here to view our report on Azadi Ka Amrit Mahotsav celebrations at 
SSSIHL 

 

 

http://www.sssihl.edu.in/wp-content/uploads/2022/08/Partition-Horrors-2022-at-SSSIHL-Summary.pdf
https://www.sssihl.edu.in/azadi-ka-amrit-mahotsav/
https://www.sssihl.edu.in/azadi-ka-amrit-mahotsav/


Here are few select pictures of the above-mentioned activities and copies of the 

certificates harghartiranga.com for your kind reference. 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 



 

 


